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⇒ About Xtend ⇒ Features
⇒ ScreenShot ⇒ Installation
⇒ Screenshots ⇒ System
Requirements ⇒ About
Xtend Xtend is a
customizable application
designed for enhancing the
control and productivity of
trading operations. From
streaming quotes and one-
click trading to innovative
features like Drag-and-Drop
Symbols, detailed trade
views, and ladder trading,
Xtend is an easy-to-use



trading software for today’s
fast -moving markets. Xtend
is the right choice for
scalping traders and
professional investors alike.
Xtend is a customizable
application designed for
enhancing the control and
productivity of trading
operations. From streaming
quotes and one-click
trading to innovative
features like Drag-and-Drop
Symbols, detailed trade
views, and ladder trading,
Xtend is an easy-to-use



trading software for today’s
fast -moving markets. Xtend
Description: ⇒ About Xtend
⇒ Features ⇒ ScreenShot ⇒
Installation ⇒ Screenshots
⇒ System Requirements ⇒
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customizable application
designed for enhancing the
control and productivity of
trading operations. From
streaming quotes and one-
click trading to innovative
features like Drag-and-Drop
Symbols, detailed trade
views, and ladder trading,



Xtend is an easy-to-use
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fast -moving markets. Xtend
is the right choice for
scalping traders and
professional investors alike.
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designed for enhancing the
control and productivity of
trading operations. - From
streaming quotes and one-
click trading to innovative
features like Drag-and-Drop
Symbols, detailed trade
views, and ladder trading,



Xtend is an easy-to-use
trading software for today’s
fast -moving markets. -
Xtend is the right choice for
scalping traders and
professional investors alike.
Xtend is a customizable
application designed for
enhancing the control and
productivity of trading
operations. From streaming
quotes and one-click
trading to innovative
features like Drag-and-Drop
Symbols, detailed trade
views, and ladder trading,



Xtend is an easy-to-use
trading software for today’s
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With the Macro-Manager of
MACRO XTEND you are
able to manage an
unlimited number of
trading strategies in a user-
friendly way. The user-
friendly MACRO XTEND
solution can be accessed
from any web browser. The
features offered by MACRO



XTEND are: - Unlimited
number of pre-configured
Macro Strategies - For each
Macro Strategy an
unlimited number of
Trading Parameters can be
specified - Fully integrated
with your broker's OMS -
Compatible with most major
brokers, such as Fidor,
iTrade, IG, FXOpen, and
many more - Results can be
sorted, calculated, sorted
by order type - Calculate
and analyse running P&L
and Value Graphs - For



example, you can easily
calculate the current
strength of an instrument
by simply pressing a button
- Calculate, sort and export
various value graphs -
Symbols, Instruments and
Trading strategies can be
imported from spreadsheets
and/or other applications -
You can easily create a new
trading strategy - You can
easily import and export
strategies from external
applications, such as Excel -
Technical trading strategies



(Fibonacci Levels, Moving
Averages, Stochastics,
Bollinger Bands, Time
Frames, MACD, etc.) -
Export Strategies to other
platforms, such as
Metatrader, TradeStation,
NinjaTrader, etc. - Full
integration with your
broker's OMS - Trading
strategies can be activated
on many instruments -
Create and manage your
own user-defined trading
strategies - You can set the
risk management of your



strategies - In-built support
for many languages -
Compatible with all major
brokers, such as Fidor,
iTrade, IG, FXOpen, and
many more - Create,
import, export, manage,
share and execute your
strategies in Xtend - View
the trading strategies of
your broker and all other
strategies - You can trade
all your strategies at once
on one account in one
broker (automated trading)
- Calculate and export



results to your favourite
charting software - For
example, you can easily
create a custom candle
chart using your chosen
trading strategy - Calculate,
sort and export various
candle- and bar chart types
- You can easily create a set
of graphs with the most
commonly used chart types
- You can easily create a
custom panel that shows
your favourite indicators -
You can easily analyse and
report on your charts -



Trend analysis of your data
- You can download
2edc1e01e8



Xtend Free

Main features of Xtend
software include: •
Extremely easy-to-use
interface that supports
drag-and-drop operations •
One-Click Trading • Create
automated trading
algorithms • Custom
Trading View (hybrid style
for faster views) • Drag-
and-Drop Symbols • Ladder
trading • Xtend new
features Other features
include: • Advanced
Strategies and Trading



Algorithms • Multiple
Broker Connections •
Interactive charts • Pre-
configured tabs to facilitate
your trading • Trade alerts
• Powerful charting tools to
give you maximum visibility
of the markets • Multi-
language support • High
performance graphs to
optimize your trading
experience • Dozens of
additional features to help
you make the most of Xtend
software Main features of
Xtend software include: •



Extremely easy-to-use
interface that supports
drag-and-drop operations •
One-Click Trading • Create
automated trading
algorithms • Custom
Trading View (hybrid style
for faster views) • Drag-
and-Drop Symbols • Ladder
trading • Xtend new
features Other features
include: • Advanced
Strategies and Trading
Algorithms • Multiple
Broker Connections •
Interactive charts • Pre-



configured tabs to facilitate
your trading • Trade alerts
• Powerful charting tools to
give you maximum visibility
of the markets • Multi-
language support • High
performance graphs to
optimize your trading
experience • Dozens of
additional features to help
you make the most of Xtend
software Main features of
Xtend software include: •
Extremely easy-to-use
interface that supports
drag-and-drop operations •



One-Click Trading • Create
automated trading
algorithms • Custom
Trading View (hybrid style
for faster views) • Drag-
and-Drop Symbols • Ladder
trading • Xtend new
features Other features
include: • Advanced
Strategies and Trading
Algorithms • Multiple
Broker Connections •
Interactive charts • Pre-
configured tabs to facilitate
your trading • Trade alerts
• Powerful charting tools to



give you maximum visibility
of the markets • Multi-
language support • High
performance graphs to
optimize your trading
experience • Dozens of
additional features to help
you make the most of Xtend
software Main features of
Xtend software include: •
Extremely easy-to-use
interface that supports
drag-and-drop
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What's New in the Xtend?

Xtend is a customizable
application designed for
enhancing the control and
productivity of trading
operations. From streaming
quotes and one-click
trading to innovative
features like Drag-and-Drop
Symbols, detailed trade
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views, and ladder trading,
Xtend is an easy-to-use
trading software for today's
fast -moving markets.
Revolutionary Trading
Interface Xtend takes the
traditional trading interface
and turns it on its head.
Xtend's unique interface is
designed to be easily
viewed from a multitude of
viewpoints. Whether you’re
a novice or experienced
trader, Xtend is the ideal
trading software for you.
Customizable Trading



Operations Xtend allows the
user to customize his
trading operations. From
creating customized graphs
and charts to the
integration of live price and
news feeds, you can put
your own trading
fingerprints on the
program. No other program
offers the trading features
you desire. Automated
Market Alerts Xtend allows
you to be alerted to the
latest changes in market
conditions that occur within



the time frame you select.
Market alerts are sent to
the program's interface,
giving you the opportunity
to monitor and react to
market developments as
they occur. I have been
using Xtend for more than
six months and it has been
a real joy to work with. The
fact that it is a fully
featured application with
detailed back office services
makes it a joy to use. I
strongly recommend it to
anyone who is looking for



an application that supports
both desktop and mobile
platforms. -Don Atherton
Amino Group Pty Ltd Xtend
is the only program I have
ever found with
comprehensive back office
service capabilities. The
interface is user friendly
and Xtend makes it easy to
access all its capabilities. -
Michael Dolger Investment
Exchange Xtend has all the
features you would expect
from a sophisticated
trading application, and



more. The customizable
feature sets enable the
program to satisfy the
needs of individual traders.
The automated alerts and
back office services will be
invaluable to most traders. -
Dr. Ray Hillman FORESTRY
COUNCIL OF CANADA
"Xtend is the best trading
program out there. It is
really customizable, and it
is the only one I use." -Mark
Tobey Telemark Energy Inc.
"Xtend is the only program
I have ever found with



comprehensive back office
service capabilities. The
interface is user friendly
and Xtend makes it easy to
access all its capabilities.
The customizable feature
sets enable the program to
satisfy the needs of
individual traders. The
automated alerts and back
office services will be
invaluable to most traders."
-Michael Dolger Investment
Exchange "Xtend is the best
trading program out there.
It is really customizable,



and it is the only one I use."
-Mark Tobey Telemark



System Requirements For Xtend:

Windows 10 or later
Windows 8 or later
Windows 7 SP1 or later
Mac OS X 10.6 or later DVD
video player Minimum of 2
GB RAM Any Pentium II or
faster processor 2.00 GHz
or faster processor
recommended Our System
Requirements:

https://finkelblogger.com/urban-lightscape-crack-with-serial-key-free-download-x
64-latest-2022/
https://niceclipart.com/iphone-battery-2009-11-02-crack-free-download-latest-20
22/
https://xn----8sbekcdvpihw5ac.xn--p1ai/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/I-Have-The-
Power-Crack-With-Serial-Key-2022.pdf
https://teenmemorywall.com/dp-search-torrents-crack-activation-win-mac/
http://grandiosotoluca.com/?p=880
https://hellandgroup.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/jakkhate.pdf

https://finkelblogger.com/urban-lightscape-crack-with-serial-key-free-download-x64-latest-2022/
https://finkelblogger.com/urban-lightscape-crack-with-serial-key-free-download-x64-latest-2022/
https://niceclipart.com/iphone-battery-2009-11-02-crack-free-download-latest-2022/
https://niceclipart.com/iphone-battery-2009-11-02-crack-free-download-latest-2022/
https://xn----8sbekcdvpihw5ac.xn--p1ai/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/I-Have-The-Power-Crack-With-Serial-Key-2022.pdf
https://xn----8sbekcdvpihw5ac.xn--p1ai/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/I-Have-The-Power-Crack-With-Serial-Key-2022.pdf
https://teenmemorywall.com/dp-search-torrents-crack-activation-win-mac/
http://grandiosotoluca.com/?p=880
https://hellandgroup.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/jakkhate.pdf


https://acaciasports.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Sherpa-Bee-Crack.pdf
https://hospiclinicsas.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Remo-Duplicate-Photos-R
emover-Crack-With-Key-Download.pdf
http://www.gea-pn.it/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Samsung-DeX-Crack-March20
22.pdf
https://www.theblender.it/sam2p-crack-free/

https://acaciasports.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Sherpa-Bee-Crack.pdf
https://hospiclinicsas.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Remo-Duplicate-Photos-Remover-Crack-With-Key-Download.pdf
https://hospiclinicsas.com/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Remo-Duplicate-Photos-Remover-Crack-With-Key-Download.pdf
http://www.gea-pn.it/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Samsung-DeX-Crack-March2022.pdf
http://www.gea-pn.it/wp-content/uploads/2022/12/Samsung-DeX-Crack-March2022.pdf
https://www.theblender.it/sam2p-crack-free/

